
B19-106 Results  

 1 

Town of Derry 

Manpower & Equipment Bid RFP 
 

 

 CONTRACTOR NAME:_________________________________________ 

 

1. BACKHOE WITH OPERATOR (RUBBER TIRES) 

         (MINIMUM THREE YEARS EXPERIENCE*) 

YEAR/MAKE MODEL        GVW  MAX DEPTH     HRLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons 2007 John Deere 310SJ           16,140  18  $110.00 

 

American Exc – 2004 CAT 430D Backhoe 16,000  15  $110.00 

American Exc – 2003 Case 580 Backhoe 14,400  14  $110.00 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

2. EXCAVATOR WITH OPERATOR (TRACK) 

         (MINIMUM THREE YEARS EXPERIENCE*) 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL  GVW  MAX DEPTH  HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons 2014 Kobelco SK260    57,000  25   $175.00 

 

American Excavating -   

2005 Volvo EC460BLC w/Hammer 120,000 13,000lb Hammer $375.00 

2001 Komatsu PC300 w/Hammer   80,000 10,000lb Hammer $300.00 

2006 Komatsu PC200LC w/Hammer   44,000   5,000lb Hammer  $275.00 

2008 Volvo EC330CL w/GPS Guidance   80,000 27ft   $260.00 

2008 Volvo EC330CL     80,000 27ft   $195.00 

2010 CAT 336DL (Three)    78,000 26ft   $195.00 

2005 CAT 330CL     76,000 26ft   $185.00 

2013 Komatsu PC228 USLC-8 (Two)   51,000 22ft   $150.00 

2012 Komatsu PC228 USLC-8 (Two)   51,000 22ft   $150.00 

CAT 315CL      38,000 20ft   $130.00 

2016 Kubota KX080-4R3 Roto Exc   18,000 15ft   $130.00 

2013 Kubota KX080-R3AT3 Roto Exc   18,000 15ft   $130.00 

2014 Kumatsu PC88 w/Thumb Att.   20,000 15ft   $120.00 

2007 Komatsu PC78 w/Thumb Att.   18,000 14ft   $115.00 

2005 Volve EC55B Excav.    10,000 12ft   $100.00 

Komatsu PC35        8,200 10ft   $100.00 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
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3. LOADER-FRONT END WITH OPERATOR       (MINIMUM TWO YEARS EXPERIENCE*) 

 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL       GVW MAX DEPTH  HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons 2015 Hyundai HL760-9A    4 ½ cy    $150.00 

 

American Excavating 

2003 CAT 966GII Wheel Loader 6cy  Bucket   $190.00 

2009 CAT 966H Wheel Loader   5 ½ cy  Bucket   $190.00 

2007 CAT 966H Wheel Loader  5 ½ cy  Bucket   $190.00 

2005 CAT 950GII Wheel Loader 4 ½ cy  Bucket   $165.00 

2011 Komatsu WA380-6 Wheel  4 cy  Bucket   $160.00 

2013 Komatsu WA320PZ-6 Wheel 3 ½ cy  Bucket   $135.00 

2012 Komatsu WA320PZ-6 Wheel 3 ½ cy  Bucket   $135.00 

2008 Komatsu WA320-5L Wheel 3 ½ cy  Bucket   $135.00 

2009 Komatsu WA250-6 Wheel  3 cy  Bucket   $125.00 

2016 Volvo L35GS Wheel Loader 1 ½ cy  Bucket   $115.00 

2015 Kubota SVL90 Compact Track 3 ½ cy  Bucket   $100.00 

 

 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

4. BULLDOZER      (MINIMUM FOUR YEARS EXPERIENCE*) 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL  GVW     HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons 2007 John Deere 650JX    19,200    $110.00 

 

American Excavating 

2003 CAT D6RXLII   43,000     $175.00 

2008 CAT D6N    36,000     $155.00 

2008 CAT D6N w/GPS Guidance 36,000     $210.00 

2017 John Deere 650HXLT  18,600     $125.00 

2003 CAT D4G XL 17,000 $115.00 

2002 CAT D3G (2)   16,000     $110.00 

 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

5. RUBBER TIRED EXCAVATOR 

        (MINIMUM FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE*) 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL  GVW     HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons – No Bid 

 

American Excavating 

Volvo EW180B    42,000  19ft   $165.00 

Volvo EW55    12,000  12ft   $115.00 

 
*MINIMUM EXPERIENCE WILL BE ON THE PIECE OF EQUIPMENT SPECIFIED. 
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6. GRADER 

        (MINIMUM FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE*) 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL  GVW     HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons – No Bid 

 

American Excavating – No Bid 

 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

7. DUMP TRUCK (6 WHEELS) 

         (CDLB REQUIRED. UP TO DATE MEDICAL CARD) 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL  GVW     HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons – 1995 Intl 51900  32,000     $ 70.00 

 

American Exc – 2002 Intl 4300  25,999     $ 70.00 

 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

8. DUMP TRUCK (10 WHEEL) 

          (CDLB REQUIRED. UP TO DATE MEDICAL CARD) 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL  GVW     HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons 2007 Intl Triaxle      $ 85.00 

 

American Excavating 

Mack or Western Star Tri-axle (10) 73,000     $ 85.00 

Mack or Kenworth Ten Wheelers (2) 57,000     $ 80.00 

 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

9. VIBRATORY ROLLER 

 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL  GVW     HOURLY RATE 

 

 

Remi & Sons – Bomag BW142D 5’ drum     $  90.00 

Remi & Sons – Bomag Hypac       $105.00 

 

American Excavating 

1999 CAT CS-563C   25,000     $130.00 

Ingersoll Rand SD115D – 84” (2) 24,000     $130.00 

Ingersoll Rand SD100 (2)  24,000     $130.00 

2004 CAT CS-323   11,000     $110.00 

2012 Bomag BW145DH-40  10,600     $110.00 

2006 CAT CB214E     5.400     $100.00 

Amman AC20      4,000     $100.00 

2004 CAT CP323 Sheep’s Foot Roller 11,000     $115.00 
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__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

10. PLATE COMPACTOR 

          DAILY RATE  

 

Remi & Sons – Reversible Plate Compactor 5,000 lb   $200.00/day 

Remi & Sons – Standard Plate Compactor     $150.00/day 

 

American Exc – Reversible Plate Compactor 5,000 lb   $210.00/day 

American Exc – Standard Plate Compactor     $160.00/day 

 
*MINIMUM EXPERIENCE WILL BE ON THE PIECE OF EQUIPMENT SPECIFIED. 

_________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

 

11. PAVEMENT CUTTER 

 

SAW TYPE         DAILY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons – 13 HP Walk Behind   $260.00/day (Cost of blades included) 

 

American Exc – No Bid 

 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

12. PIPE SAW         DAILY RATE      

 

Remi & Sons - Pipe saw w/blades included     $ 90.00/day 

          

American Exc – Pipe Saw (No Blades)      $ 90.00/day + blades 

 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

13.  AIR COMPRESSORS WITH TOOLS     DAILY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons - Ingersoll Rand       $345.00/day 

Remi & Sons – Tools & Hoses (25ft)      $  15.00/day 

 

American Exc – Ingersoll Rand 185 CFM     $350.00/day 

American Exc – Ingersoll Rand P185WJD     $350.00/day 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

14. PICK UP  TRUCK 

 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL  GVW      HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons – Chevy 1 ton Pkup      $ 40.00 

Remi & Sons – 1 ton Pick Up(s) utility body     $ 50.00 

 

American Exc – Ford 1-ton Tool Truck (2)     $ 65.00 

American Exc – Pick Up Trucks (2)      $ 35.00 

_________________________________________________________________________________ 
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15.  JOB FOREMAN & LABORERS     HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons - Job Forman *       $80.00 

Remi & Sons – Laborers       $55.00 

 

American Exc - Job Forman * (Qualified to set grades)    $85.00 

American Exc – Laborers       $55.00 

 

* The need for a job foreman, will be determined by the Town.  Contractors should not assume that 

each job would require a foreman. 

 

 

16.  HEAVY EQUIPMENT OPERATOR  

 

CAPABLE OF OPERATING HEAVY EQUIPMENT TO INCLUDE; BULLDOZERS UP TO 

D-9, EXCAVATORS UP TO 235 CAT., DUMP TRUCKS UP TO TRI-XLE, ETC.  

MINIMUM ( SIX (6) YEARS EXPERIENCE. 

 

         HOURLY RATE 

Remi & Sons – No Bid 

 

American Exe – No Bid 

_________________________________________________________________________________ 

17.  BULLDOZER (D-8 OR EQUIVALENT W/OPERATOR) 

 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL      HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons – No Bid 

 

American Exc – Intl TD25       $245.00 

 

________________________________________________________________________________ 

18.  BULLDOZER (D-9 OR EQUIVALENT W/OPERATOR) 

 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL      HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons – No Bid 

 

American Exc – CAT D-9       $295.00 

 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 

19.  BULLDOZER (D4 OR EQUIVALENT W/OPERATOR) 

 (MINIMUM THREE YEARS EXPERIENCE) 

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL      HOURLY RATE 

 

Remi & Sons – 2007 John Deere 650JX 19,200    $110.00 

 

American Excavating 

2003 CAT D6RXLII    43,000    $175.00 

2008 CAT D6N     36,000    $155.00 

2008 CAT D6N  w/GPS Guidance  36,000    $210.00 

2003 John Deere 650HXLT   18,600    $120.00 

2003 CAT D4G XL    17,000    $115.00 
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20.  OTHER EQUIPMENT 

 

PLEASE LIST WITH RATES 

EQUIPMENT NAME       RATE 

 

Remi & Sons  

Breaker/Hammer (3,000#-5,000#)    $395.00/hr (6 hr min w/move) 

Trommel Power Screener (based upon availability)  Per Month only 

JD310 Backhoe w/Street Sweeper    $125.00/hr 

Lowbed & Tractor      $125.00/hr 

Generator       $165.00/day 

National Crane       $900.00/day 

 

American Excavating 

1983 Ford Utility Broom Tractor/Sweeper   $110.00/hr 

Tractor/Trailer Dumps (2)     $100.00/hr 

Lowbed Tractor Trailer      $140.00/hr 

Flowboy Tractor Trailer      $125.00/hr 

2012 CAT 725 Articulating Rock Trucks (4)   $165.00/hr 

1999 CAT 350E 6x6 Articulating Rock Truck   $170.00/hr 

CAT D25 Articulating Rock Truck    $150.00/hr 

1999 Midland Road Widener     $  75.00/hr 

CAT D250E II Water Truck     $160.00/hr 

Water Trucks (on site only) (2)     $100.00/hr/mobilization 

Water Truck (on road)      $110.00/hr 

RD90 Reed Screen All      $2,200.00/wk + price of move 

McClosky MCB516RE Trommel Screener   Call for Pricing 

Powerscreen Chieftain 1400 Screener    Call for Pricing 

Komatsu BR550 Versahandler Crusher    $275.00/hr + price of move 

Pegson Maxtrak Cone Crusher     $275.00/hr + price of move 

 

 

21. ROADSIDE MOWING 

 

EQUIPMENT NAME       RATE 

    

Remi & Sons – No Bid     

 

American Excavating – No Bid 

_______________________________________________________________________________ 

22. DRAINAGE INSTALLATION 
 

This work will include all tools, trucks, manpower, traffic control, signs, and equipment necessary to install dual 

wall polyethylene pipe(aka.ADS or Hancor). It will include all labor to excavate, lay pipe to grade, and backfill 

in compacted lifts. All sand, gravel, stone, and pipe material will be supplied by the Town, but must be picked up 

by the contractor at the “Town Yard” unless otherwise agreed upon. Work to be completed at the direction and 

supervision of department employees. * Does not include ledge excavation. 

 

Remi & Sons – Will Quote based upon location and as needed 

 

American Excavating – No Bid 
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  6”ADS (underdrain) 2’-3’ deep  $_____________/foot 

12”ADS   3’-5’ deep   $_____________/foot 

12”ADS   6’-9’ deep  $_____________/foot 

12”ADS   7’-12’deep  $_____________/foot  

15”ADS   3’-5’ deep  $_____________/foot 

15”ADS   6’-9’ deep  $_____________/foot 

15”ADS   7’-12’ deep  $_____________/foot 

18”ADS   3’-5’ deep  $_____________/foot 

18”ADS   6’-9’ deep  $_____________/foot 

18”ADS   7’-12’ deep  $_____________/foot 

24”ADS   3’-5’ deep  $_____________/foot 

24”ADS   6’-9’ deep  $_____________/foot 

24”ADS   7’-12’ deep  $_____________/foot 

30”ADS   3’-5’ deep  $_____________/foot 

30”ADS   6’-9’ deep  $_____________/foot 

30”ADS   7’-12’ deep  $_____________/foot 

 

Catch Basins Installed and backfilled. 

 

All materials to be supplied by the town including sumps, risers, cones, top slabs, bricks, blocks, and mortar. 

These materials will be picked up by the contractor at the “Town Yard” unless otherwise agreed upon. Vertical 

footage will be measured from the bottom of the sump to the top of the rim on the casting. 

 

4’ inside diameter    $_____________/ Vertical foot 

6’ inside diameter    $_____________/ Vertical foot 

 

Ledge 

 

If ledge is encountered on projects under the above reference work the Town will be responsible for costs 

associated with blasting and/or hoe ramming of the ledge.  

 

Note: 

Usage of this item for drainage installation will be based on a typical one-day minimum of work ( 150-200 linear 

feet, plus one structure). * Contractors should be aware that the Town will insist that proper compaction 

techniques be utilized to provide a stable and safe trench. These techniques must conform to N.H.D.O.T. 

specifications.  

 

These prices are based on installation of pipe in areas with little or no buried utilities on roadways with light 

traffic. Prices will be renegotiated in areas with multiple utilities and/or high traffic volumes. Furthermore, these 

prices reflect graveling to grade and do not include pavement restoration. 

 

If conditions or circumstances dictate, the Town reserves the right to revert to the hourly equipment/manpower 

rates of the contractor performing the work, therefore it is important that contractors who submit bids for this 

item also submit bids for equipment/manpower rental. Additionally, the Town reserves the right to discharge said 

contractor if work is not progressing in a satisfactory manner. This decision will be at the Town’s discretion. 

 

*  The reference to minimum work of 150-200 feet per day refers to installation of new drainage piping; 

conditions and circumstances may allow or restrict the lineal footage in any particular day. 
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23. HYDRANT SNOW REMOVAL – LOADER/BACKHOE LABORER 

 

         HOURLY RATE 

Remi & Sons 

- Loader        $90.00 

- Backhoe         $90.00 

- Laborer        $60.00 

 

American Excavating 

- Loader        $90.00 

- Backhoe         $90.00 

- Laborer        $55.00 

 

24. TRENCH / HAND PAVING WORK 

 
This work will include manpower, traffic control (if other than Police Detail), signs, preparation work, tack coat, 

saw-cutting, milling, installing 2 ½” of base course and 1 ½” of wearing course. 

 

         SQUARE FT RATE 

 

- Trench/Hand paving work      ___No Bids_______ 

 

 

25. CHIPPER / BUCKET TRUCK            

   HOURLY RATE 
 

 

No Bids 

 

Bucket Truck with a reach of no less than 70 vertical feet with operator     _______________ 

 

12” Chipper w/enclosed dump body chip truck capacity no less than 15 CY _______________ 

 

18” Chipper w/ enclosed dump body chip truck capacity no less than 15 CY _______________ 

 

          

 

 

The above listed bids are due on June 1, 2018 at 4:00 p.m.   All bids must be received prior to 

1:00 p.m. at the Derry Public Works Office, Derry Municipal Center, 14 Manning St., Derry, 

New Hampshire.  Sealed envelopes containing bids must be clearly marked: 

 

 “Manpower/Equipment Bid”. 

 

All bids are considered valid until June 30, 2019 

 

It must be noted that the Town requires that all contractors who work for the Town must carry 

sufficient insurance for all equipment and manpower and must present said insurance to the 

Town. 

 

 

 


